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Chapeau 
FCE is a civil society organization whose aim is to promote equity, equality and justice in all action 
undertaken under any vital livelihood areas for the good of every being on the planet. We are cognizant of 
the effects of climate change on all the sectors of life on the planet earth. We are convinced that the success 
or failure of any plan for the future made by the UN, institutions, governments, actors and stakeholders 
mainly depends on the effort put in, commitment towards, actual action taken on and the level of 
achievements on climate change. 

 

Chapter I. Sustainable development and financing for development 

The global aid system as it is to date has yielded no results at all for underdeveloped countries; and this for 
decades. We believe that each nation has enough resources within to finance their development and sustain 
the wellbeing of their population. Each country should independently come up with an appropriate 
development plan inspired by and addressing the needs and expectations of the population. The plan should 
never serve any political interest and should be at least 90% locally financed, if not totally.     

 

Chapter II. International peace and security 

Despite the existence of the UN Security Council and the many UN peace keeping missions deployed over 
centuries, the world has become more and more unstable and insecure. For international peace and security 
to become a reality we recommend a more inclusive approach to be adopted. The first step towards this 
inclusion is to make at least one African nation to be a permanent member of the UN Security Council.   

 

Chapter III. Science, technology and innovation and digital cooperation 

Technological innovation is good, but it should be allowed and accepted within the limits of not causing 
more harm to the already ruined nature and environment.  

 

Chapter IV. Youth and future generations 

The youth should be prepared to take up the mantle in the future and for the future generation. Therefore, 
the youth should be educated in the matter that matters most, which is how to take care of the environment 
in all they do. Each country should seriously initiate and implement an education program for the youth on 

 

     



Environmental Sustainability and Climate Change Action. This is the only way to secure the future 
generation.  

 

Chapter V. Transforming global governance 

Democracy has caused more trouble than stability and prosperity all over the world, especially in Africa. 
Most of the globally accepted governance systems have not helped promote transparency and eliminate 
corruption. While intended to promote peace and freedom, these systems have given an opportunity to the 
unprepared and corrupt individuals to take advantage of the same systems to cause trouble and instability 
by, for instance, conducting destructive demonstrations, starting rebellions and wars, promoting and living 
immoral and corrupt lives, etc. We suggest that every nation should be free to define an appropriate 
governance relevant to their own reality and holistic development. No governance system should be 
imposed to any nation, as a condition to receive any kind of help or assistance. 


