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  Forthcoming official meetings  

  Tuesday, 8 October 2013 

General Assembly 
Sixty-eighth session 

High-level Dialogue on Financing for Development1

(7-8 October 2013)  

10:00  31st plenary meeting    General Assembly Hall (NLB) 

  Follow-up to and implementation of the outcome of the 2002 International Conference 
on Financing for Development and the 2008 Review Conference: High-level Dialogue 
on Financing for Development [item 18] 

10:00      Economic and Social Council Chamber (CB) 

  Round table 2: “Mobilization of public and private financing, including foreign direct  
investment and other private flows, and fostering international trade and sustainable 
debt financing, in the context of financing for development” 

10:00         Conference Room 2 (CB) 

  Round table 3: “The role of financial and technical development cooperation, including  
innovative sources of development finance, in leveraging the mobilization of domestic 
and international financial resources for sustainable development” 

15:00          General Assembly Hall (NLB) 

  Informal interactive dialogue: “The link between financing for development and 
achieving the internationally agreed development goals, including the Millennium 
Development Goals, and advancing the United Nations development agenda beyond 
2015” 

17:45  32nd plenary meeting    General Assembly Hall (NLB)

                                                         
1Information related to the High-level Dialogue and the other round tables is contained in pages 9 and 10. 
 

General Assembly 
Sixty-eighth session 

  . . . 

http://undocs.org/A/68/100
http://undocs.org/A/68/100/Add.1
http://undocs.org/A/67/150
http://undocs.org/A/68/252
http://undocs.org/A/INF/68/3
http://undocs.org/A/INF/68/4/Rev/1
http://undocs.org/A/67/49(Vol.I)
http://undocs.org/A/67/49(Vol.II)
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  High-level Dialogue on Financing for Development 
  (7-8 October 2013)  

  The organizational arrangements are described in General Assembly resolution 67/300 
of 16 September 2013. A letter from the President of the General Assembly, dated 
25 September 2013, was sent to all permanent representatives and permanent observers. 

  Statements for the formal plenary meetings should not exceed five minutes when 
speaking in a national capacity, and seven minutes when speaking on behalf of a group. 

  Interventions in the interactive round table discussions should not exceed three minutes 
each. Intervention in the interactive dialogue should not exceed three minutes when 
speaking in a national capacity, and five minutes when speaking on behalf of a group. 
For further information on the round table, kindly contact the respective secretaries as 
follows: Round table 1: Ms. Rachel Stein-Holmes (stein-holmes@un.org); Round table 
2: Ms. Svetlana Emelina-Sarte (emelina@un.org); and Round table 3: Ms. Sangeeta 
Sharma (sharma7@un.org). 

  Member States and observers, including relevant intergovernmental organizations are 
reminded that the names of their representatives should be submitted, as soon as 
possible, to the Financing for Development Office (e-mail alfonso@un.org; tel. 1 (212) 
963-4598; room DC2-2162; fax 1 (212) 963-0443) with a copy to the United Nations 
Protocol and Liaison Service (tel. 1 (212) 963-7181; room S-0212; fax 1 (212) 963-
1921). 

  The list of non-State participants in the round tables and the informal interactive 
dialogue will be established on a first-come, first-served basis. Representatives of these 
non-state entities wishing to participate in these meetings should inscribe with the 
Financing for Development Office (e-mail platz@un.org; tel. 1 (212) 963-3664; room 
DC2-2156; fax 1 (212) 963-0443). 

  Further information on the High-level Dialogue may be obtained from the meeting 
website. 

http://undocs.org/A/RES/67/300
mailto:stein-holmes@un.org
mailto:emelina@un.org
mailto:sharma7@un.org
mailto:alfonso@un.org
mailto:platz@un.org
http://www.un.org/esa/ffd/hld/HLD2013/index.htm
http://www.un.org/esa/ffd/hld/HLD2013/index.htm
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