




The court may only reach a decision according to section 130 litra a and 242 
litra a, if it is strictly necessary and does not give rise to substantial doubts in 
regard to the defence of the person charged. 

According to The Act relating to the Courts of Justice section 125, the court 
may decide to close a hearing, e.g. when a witness is being examined. 
Furthermore, the Criminal Procedure Act section 284 states that the court may 
decide that a person indicted shall leave the courtroom while a witness is being 
examined, if there is special reason to fear that an unreserved statement will not 
otherwise be made. According to section l 09 litra a, the court may examine 

witnesses by distant examination. Moreover, The Criminal Procedure Act 
sections 239-239 litra f stipulate rules concerning facilitated interviews in 
Children's homes and orphanages. Facilitated interviews should, among other 
things, be used when interviewing witnesses younger than the age of 16 in 
cases involving sex offences, assault and battery, homicide, abuse in close 
relationships, and female genital mutilation. 

Witness support offers conversation partners for witnesses in Norwegian 
courts, provides human support and offers guidance on the procedure in the 
courtroom, primarily in criminal cases. The witness support scheme is 
essentially organised as a collaboration between the courts' central 
administration, the Norwegian Courts Administration and a voluntary 
organisation, the Norwegian Red Cross, where witness support is provided as 
voluntary work. The said scheme is not regulated by law. 

Please rest assured that Norway will continue to take an active approach to 
ensure the effective implementation of the provisions of General Assembly 
resolution 73/196 (2018). 

The Permanent Mission of Norway to the United Nations avails itself of this 
opportunity to renew to the Office of Legal Affairs of the United Nations the 
assurances of its highest consideration. 
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