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Information for participants 
 

 
Workshop to discuss the implementation of paragraphs 113, 117 and 119 to 124 of resolution 64/72, 
paragraphs 121, 126, 129, 130 and 132 to 134 of resolution 66/68 and paragraphs 156, 171, 175, 177 
to 188 and 219 of resolution 71/123 on sustainable fisheries, addressing the impacts of bottom 
fishing on vulnerable marine ecosystems and the long-term sustainability of deep-sea fish stocks will 
be held at United Nations Headquarters in New York, from 2 to 3 August 2022. The Workshop will 
take place in Conference Room 3 at United Nations Headquarters, New York, starting at 10am on 
Tuesday 2 August 2022.  
 
States, the Food and Agriculture Organization of the United Nations (FAO) and other relevant 
specialized agencies, funds and programmes, subregional and regional fisheries management 
organizations and arrangements, other fisheries bodies, other relevant intergovernmental bodies 
and relevant non-governmental organizations and relevant stakeholders, in accordance with United 
Nations practice, are invited to attend the workshop. 
 
Working documents 
 
The working documents for the meeting will be made available at:  
https://www.un.org/depts/los/bottom_fishing_workshop.htm 
 
Registration 
 
All delegations participating in the workshop are kindly invited to inform the Secretariat of the 
meeting (Division for Ocean Affairs and the Law of the Sea, Office of Legal Affairs), the names of 
their representatives attending the Workshop, preferably in electronic form (e-mail: doalos@un.org 
with a copy to amerim@un.org) as soon as possible and latest by 22 July 2022, if they have not yet 
done so. 
 
UN Grounds Passes  
Intergovernmental organizations  
Representatives from intergovernmental organizations invited to attend the Workshop should 
communicate their intention to attend the meeting directly to the Protocol and Liaison Service 
(unprotocol@un.org) as soon as possible, with a copy to the Division for Ocean Affairs and the Law 
of the Sea, Office of Legal Affairs (doalos@un.org), for issuance of grounds passes, which allow 
access to the United Nations premises. The procedure for such requests is outlined in the invitation 

https://www.un.org/depts/los/bottom_fishing_workshop.htm
mailto:amerim@un.org


 

 

 

letter to the meeting. The representatives of intergovernmental organizations having a Liaison Office 
in New York must get their pass from their respective Liaison Office.  
 
Non-governmental organizations  
For non-governmental organizations with consultative status with ECOSOC, please visit 
http://csonet.org/?menu=86 for the issuance of grounds passes. For other non-governmental 
organizations invited to attend the Workshop, the names and contact details of representatives 
should be communicated to the Division (doalos@un.org with a copy to amerim@un.org) as soon as 
possible and latest by 22 July 2022 for issuance of grounds passes, to allow access to the United 
Nations premises. The Division will communicate directly to the non-governmental organization 
representatives the venue, date and time for pick-up of their UN grounds pass. An official document 
(e.g., passport) identifying the representative should be presented at the time of pick-up of the 
grounds pass.  
 
Secretariat  
The Division for Ocean Affairs and the Law of the Sea, Office of Legal Affairs, will carry out the 
secretariat functions for the meeting. Requests for further information can be sent by e-mail to 
doalos@un.org, using the subject: “2022 bottom fishing workshop”. 
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